UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT SOUTHERN DISTRICT OF FLORIDA WEST PALM BEACH DIVISION

www.flsb.uscourts.gov

In re:	Chapter 11
PALM BEACH FINANCE PARTNERS, L.P.,	Case No. 09-36379-BKC-PGH
a Delaware limited partnership, et al.,1	Jointly Administered
Debtors.	

SUMMARY OF FOURTH POST-CONFIRMATION APPLICATION FOR ALLOWANCE AND PAYMENT OF COMPENSATION AND REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES INCURRED BY KINETIC PARTNERS (CAYMAN) LTD., AS CONSULTANT FOR GEOFFREY VARGA, THE LIQUIDATING TRUST MONITOR FOR PALM BEACH FINANCE II, L.P. FOR THE PERIOD OF NOVEMBER 1, 2011 THROUGH FEBRUARY 29, 2012

1. Name of applicant: Kinetic Partners (Cayman) Ltd.

2. Role of applicant: Consultant for Geoffrey Varga, the Liquidating Trust Monitor for Palm Beach Finance II, L.P.

3. Name of certifying professional: Geoffrey E. Varga

4. Date case filed: November 30, 2009

5. Date of application for employment: December 27, 2010

6. Date of order approving employment: January 27, 2011, nunc pro tunc to November 1, 2010

7. Date of Disclosure of Compensation (FRBP 2016): N/A

8. Date of this Application: April 30, 2012

9. Dates of Services Covered: November 1, 2011 through February 29, 2012

¹ The address and last four digits of the taxpayer identification number for each of the Debtors follows in parenthesis: (i) Palm Beach Finance Partners, L.P., 3601 PGA Blvd, Suite 301, Palm Beach Gardens, FL 33410 (TIN 9943); and (ii) Palm Beach Finance II, L.P., 3601 PGA Blvd, Suite 301, Palm Beach Gardens, FL 33410 (TIN 0680).

Fees Requested

13. Net Amount of Fees Requested	\$71,634.50
12. Fees paid or advanced for this period, by other sources	N/A
11. Balance remaining in fee retainer account, not yet awarded	\$0.00
10. Total fees requested for this period	\$71,634.50

Expenses Requested

1924.311

14. Total expense reimbursement requested	\$342.16
15. Balance remaining in expense retainer account, not yet received	N/A
16. Expenses paid or advanced for this period, by other sources	N/A
17. Net Amount of Expense Reimbursements Requested	\$342.16

18. Gross award requested for this period (#10 + #14)	\$71,976.66
19. Net award requested for this period (#13 + #17)	\$71,976.66

- 20. If <u>Final</u> Fee Application, amounts of net awards requested in interim Applications, but <u>not previously awarded</u> (total from History of Fees and Expenses):
- 21. Final fee and expense award requested (#20 + #21)

History of Fees and Expenses

- 1. Dates, sources, and amounts of retainers received: N/A
- 2. Dates, sources and amounts of third party payments received during the period:

Dates	Sources	Amounts	Fees or Costs?	Description	Period
12/30/2011	Barry E. Mukamal, as Liq. Trustee	\$4,730.94	Fees	18% due by Palm Beach Finance Partners, L.P.	November 2011
12/30/2011	Barry E. Mukamal, as Liq. Trustee	\$25,759.06	Fees	82% due by Palm Beach Finance II, L.P.	November 2011
2/7/2012	Barry E. Mukamal, as Liq. Trustee	\$1,139.67	Fees	18% due by Palm Beach Finance Partners, L.P.	December 2011
2/7/2012	Barry E. Mukamal, as Liq. Trustee	\$7,120.33	Fees	82% due by Palm Beach Finance II, L.P.	December 2011
3/13/2012	Barry E. Mukamal, as Liq. Trustee	\$2,513.61	Fees	18% due by Palm Beach Finance Partners, L.P.	January 2012
3/13/2012	Barry E. Mukamal, as Liq. Trustee	\$14,242.39	Fees	82% due by Palm Beach Finance II, L.P.	January 2012
4/4/2012	Barry E. Mukamal, as Liq. Trustee	\$2,460.45	Fees	18% due by Palm Beach Finance Partners, L.P.	February 2012
4/4/2012	Barry E. Mukamal, as Liq. Trustee	\$14,010.21	Fees & Costs	82% due by Palm Beach Finance II, L.P.	February 2012

3. Prior fee and expense awards:

Date	Application	⊌rder	Fees Awarded	Expenses Awarded
Requested 3/15/2011	First Post Confirmation Application	Order Approving First Post-Confirmation Application and Awarding Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses Incurred by Kinetic Partners (Cayman) Ltd., as Consultant for Geoffrey Varga, the Liquidating Trust Monitor for Palm Beach Finance II, L.P. for the Period of November 1, 2010 through January 31, 2011 [ECF No. 633], dated April 13, 2011	\$35,065.00	\$0.00
8/1/2011	Second Post Confirmation Application	Order Approving Second Post-Confirmation Application and Awarding Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses Incurred by Kinetic Partners (Cayman) Ltd., as Consultant for Geoffrey Varga, the Liquidating Trust Monitor for Palm Beach Finance II, L.P. for the Period of February 1, 2011 through June 30, 2011 [ECF No. 736], dated September 1, 2011	\$156,654.25	\$10.50
12/28/2011	Third Post Confirmation Application	Order Approving Third Post-Confirmation Application and Awarding Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses Incurred by Kinetic Partners (Cayman) Ltd., as Consultant for Geoffrey Varga, the Liquidating Trust Monitor for Palm Beach Finance II, L.P. for the Period of July 1, 2011 through October 31, 2011 [ECF No. 1088], dated February 15, 2012.	\$157,662.25	\$834.02

UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT SOUTHERN DISTRICT OF FLORIDA WEST PALM BEACH DIVISION

www.flsb.uscourts.gov

_	
[1]	16:

Chapter 11

PALM BEACH FINANCE PARTNERS, L.P., a Delaware limited partnership, et al.,

Case No. 09-36379-BKC-PGH

Jointly Administered

Debtors.

181.611.6

was gry this.

FOURTH POST-CONFIRMATION APPLICATION FOR ALLOWANCE AND PAYMENT OF COMPENSATION AND REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES INCURRED BY KINETIC PARTNERS (CAYMAN) LTD., AS CONSULTANT FOR GEOFFREY VARGA, THE LIQUIDATING TRUST MONITOR FOR PALM BEACH FINANCE II, L.P. FOR THE PERIOD OF NOVEMBER 1, 2011 THROUGH FEBRUARY 29, 2012

Kinetic Partners (Cayman) Ltd. (the "Firm" or the "Applicant"), as consultant for Geoffrey Varga, in his capacity as the Liquidating Trust Monitor for Palm Beach Finance II, L.P. (the "Monitor"), respectfully makes this application (the "Application") for entry of an order, pursuant to 11 U.S.C. §330, 331, 503(b)(2), the Confirmation Order and the Liquidating Trust Agreements for the Palm Beach Finance Partners and Palm Beach Finance II Liquidating Trusts, allowing and awarding to the Firm, as an administrative expense, the total amount of \$71,976.66 consisting of fees in the amount of \$71,634.50 and reimbursement for actual and necessary expenses incurred in the amount of \$342.16 during the period of November 1, 2011 through February 29, 2012 (the "Application Period"). In the Application Period, a total of 162.3 hours were expended by the Firm in its representation of the Monitor, for an average hourly rate of \$428.75 during the Application Period.

¹ Capitalized terms not defined herein shall have the meaning given such terms in the Plan, as defined below.

Pursuant to Section 7.1.11 of the Second Amended Joint Plan of Liquidation of Barry Mukamal, as Chapter 11 Trustee of Palm Beach Finance Partners, L.P. and Palm Beach Finance II, L.P., and Geoffrey Varga, as Joint Official Liquidator for Palm Beach Offshore, Ltd. and Palm Beach Offshore II, Ltd. (the "Plan"), and the PBF II Liquidating Trust Agreement authorized thereunder, professionals retained by the Liquidating Trustee and Monitor are authorized to receive monthly interim compensation for fees and expenses incurred in carrying out their duties consistent with the Plan and Liquidating Trust Agreements from Trust Assets of the Liquidating Trusts, as long as: (i) notice of the fees and expenses are provided on a monthly basis to the Liquidating Trustee and U.S. Trustee; (ii) no written objections to the fees and expenses sought are received within 10 business days (if objections to the fees and expenses are timely made and cannot be resolved amicably, the Court is to hear and resolve the objections); and (iii) professionals submit applications to the Court for final approval of reimbursement of fees and expenses previously paid to them, no less than once every four (4) months. The Firm has already received payment from the Liquidating Trustee for services rendered to the Monitor during the Application Period and makes this Application to obtain final allowance of the fees and expenses already paid.

I. <u>JURISDICTION</u>

This Court has jurisdiction over this Application pursuant to 28 U.S.C. §§ 157 and 1334, and the Court's retained jurisdiction pursuant to the Confirmation Order. Venue is proper pursuant to 28 U.S.C. §§ 1408 and 1409. This matter is core pursuant to 28 U.S.C. § 157(b)(2). The statutory predicate for the relief sought herein is sections 330, 331 and 503(b)(2) of the Bankruptcy Code.

Regarded to

II. INTRODUCTION

A. Allocation of Request For Professionals' Fees And Reimbursement of Expenses

In this Application, the Firm requests compensation and reimbursement of expenses in the amount of \$71,976.66 in connection with 162.3 hours worked and expenses incurred on behalf of the Monitor.

B. Retainer Paid To The Firm

None.

C. The Exhibits To This Application

There are a total number of 4 exhibits attached to this Application. The exhibits are as follows:

EXHIBIT NO.

Exhibit 1 Sun

Summary of Professional Time

Exhibit 2

Summary of Requested Reimbursement of Expenses

Exhibit 3

Certification

Composite Exhibit 4

Contemporaneous Time and Expense Records

III. BACKGROUND

1. On November 30, 2009 (the "Petition Date"), Palm Beach Finance Partners, L.P. and Palm Beach Finance II, L.P. (the "Debtors") commenced these bankruptcy cases by each filing a voluntary petition for relief under Chapter 11 of the Bankruptcy Code in the United States Bankruptcy Court for the Southern District of Florida, West Palm Beach Division.

- 2. On January 28, 2010, in connection with motions filed by the U.S. Trustee for the Southern District of Florida (the "<u>U.S. Trustee</u>") and Geoffrey Varga, as Joint Official Liquidator of Palm Beach Offshore, Ltd. and Palm Beach Offshore II, Ltd. (the "<u>JOL</u>"), the Court entered an order granting the motion to appoint a Chapter 11 trustee and directed the U.S. Trustee to appoint a Chapter 11 trustee. On or about January 29, 2010, the U.S. Trustee selected Barry Mukamal as the Chapter 11 trustee of the Debtors (the "<u>Chapter 11 Trustee</u>"). This selection was approved on February 2, 2010 by Order of the Court.
- 3. On August 27, 2010, the Chapter 11 Trustee and the JOL, as co-plan proponents, filed their Amended Disclosure Statement and First Amended Plan, and, on September 3, 2010, the Plan Proponents filed their Second Amended Disclosure Statement and the Second Amended Plan (the "Plan").
- 4. On October 21, 2010, following a hearing on October 19, 2010, the Court entered an order confirming the Plan.
- 5. Pursuant to the Plan, on the Effective Date of the Plan, the Chapter 11 Trustee, on behalf of the Debtors and the Beneficiaries, executed the Liquidating Trust Agreements thereby establishing the Liquidating Trusts for the estates of each of the Debtors.
- 6. Pursuant to the Plan, Barry Mukamal was appointed the Liquidating Trustee with the power and authority set forth in the Liquidating Trust Agreements, subject only (in the case of the PBF II Liquidating Trust Agreement) to the power and authority granted to the Monitor in the Plan and the PBF II Liquidating Trust Agreement. Pursuant to the Plan, Geoffrey Varga, as JOL was appointed the Monitor with the power and authority set forth in the PBF II Liquidating Trust Agreement.

- 7. The PBF II Liquidating Trust Agreement authorizes the Monitor to employ and pay reasonable compensation to attorneys, accountants, appraisers, expert witnesses, insurance adjusters or other persons whose services, in the sole judgment of the Monitor, may be reasonably necessary or advisable to advise or assist him in the discharge of his duties, or otherwise in the exercise of any powers vested in the Monitor.
- 8. On December 27, 2010, the Monitor filed the Application to Employ Geoffrey Varga of Kinetic Partners (Cayman) Ltd. as Consultant to the Liquidating Trust Monitor (the "Retention Application") [ECF. No. 505]. On January 27, 2011, the Court entered an order approving the employment of Geoffrey Varga and Kinetic Partners (Cayman) Ltd., nunc protunc to November 1, 2010, pursuant to the terms of the Retention Application [ECF No. 555].
- Pursuant to Section 7.1.11 of the Plan, professionals retained by the Liquidating Trustee and Monitor are authorized to receive monthly interim compensation for fees and expenses incurred in carrying out their duties consistent with the Plan and Liquidating Trust Agreements from Trust Assets of the Liquidating Trusts, as long as: (i) notice of the fees and expenses are provided on a monthly basis to the Liquidating Trustee and U.S. Trustee; (ii) no written objections to the fees and expenses sought are received within 10 business days (if objections to the fees and expenses are timely made and cannot be resolved amicably, the Court is to hear and resolve the objections); and (iii) professionals submit applications to the Court for final approval of reimbursement of fees and expenses previously paid to them, no less than once every four (4) months.
- 10. On March 15, 2011, the Firm filed its First Post-Confirmation Application for Allowance and Payment of Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses Incurred by Kinetic

11 (1 1 E 1 E 1 E 1

Partners (Cayman) Ltd, as Consultant to Geoffrey Varga, the Liquidating Trust Monitor for Palm Beach Finance II, L.P. for the Period of November 1, 2010 Through January 31, 2011 seeking allowance and payment of fees in the amount of \$35,065.00 (the "First Post-Confirmation Application") [ECF No. 613]. On April 13, 2011, the Court entered an order granting the First Post-Confirmation Application. [ECF No. 633].

- 11. On August 1, 2011, the Firm filed its Second Post-Confirmation Application for Allowance and Payment of Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses Incurred by Kinetic Partners (Cayman) Ltd, as Consultant to Geoffrey Varga, the Liquidating Trust Monitor for Palm Beach Finance II, L.P. for the Period of February 1, 2011 Through June 30, 2011 seeking allowance and payment of fees in the amount of \$156,664.75 (the "Second Post-Confirmation Application") [ECF No. 678]. On September 1, 2011, the Court entered an order granting the Second Post-Confirmation Application. [ECF No. 736].
- 12. On December 28, 2011, the Firm filed its Third Post-Confirmation Application for Allowance and Payment of Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses Incurred by Kinetic Partners (Cayman) Ltd, as Consultant to Geoffrey Varga, the Liquidating Trust Monitor for Palm Beach Finance II, L.P. for the Period of July 1 2011 through October 31, 2011 seeking allowance and payment of fees in the amount of \$157,662.25 and \$834.02 in expenses (the "Third Post-Confirmation Application") [ECF No. 1025]. On February 15, 2012, the Court entered an order granting the Third Post-Confirmation Application. [ECF No. 1088].
- 13. Pursuant to Section 7.1.11 of the Plan, on December 15, 2011, the Firm submitted to the Liquidating Trustee and the U.S. Trustee its invoice for services rendered to the Monitor for the period November 1, 2011 through November 30, 2011 in the amount of \$30,490.00

(\$30,490.00 for fees and \$0.00 for expenses). No objection to the requested fees or costs was lodged. To date, \$30,490.00 has been paid to the Firm for services rendered to, or expenses incurred on behalf of, the Monitor from November 1, 2011 through November 30, 2011.

- 14. Pursuant to Section 7.1.11 of the Plan, on January 13, 2012, the Firm submitted to the Liquidating Trustee and the U.S. Trustee its invoice for services rendered to the Monitor for the period December 1, 2011 through December 31, 2011 in the amount of \$8,260.00 (\$8,260.00 for fees and \$0.00 for expenses). No objection to the requested fees was lodged. Accordingly, \$8,260.00 has been paid to the Firm for services rendered to, or expenses incurred on behalf of, the Monitor for December 1, 2011 through December 31, 2011.
- 15. Pursuant to Section 7.1.11 of the Plan, on February 15, 2012, the Firm submitted to the Liquidating Trustee and the U.S. Trustee its invoice for services rendered to the Monitor for the period January 1, 2012 through January 31, 2012 in the amount of \$16,756.00 (\$16,756.00 for fees and \$0.00 for expenses). No objection to the requested fees or costs was lodged. Accordingly, \$16,756.00 has been paid to the Firm for services rendered to, or expenses incurred on behalf of, the Monitor for January 1, 2012 through January 31, 2012.
- 16. Pursuant to Section 7.1.11 of the Plan, on November 15, 2011, the Firm submitted to the Liquidating Trustee and the U.S. Trustee its invoice for services rendered to the Monitor for the period February 1, 2012 through February 29, 2012 in the amount of \$16,470.66 (\$16,128.50 for fees and \$342.16 for expenses). No objection to the requested fees or costs was lodged. Accordingly, \$16,470.66 has been paid to the Firm for services rendered to, or expenses incurred on behalf of, the Monitor for February 1, 2012 through February 29, 2012.

1 44 4

17. By this Application, the Firm seeks final allowance of payments already received for services rendered to the Monitor and expenses incurred in representing the Monitor during this fourth post-effective date period of November 1, 2011 through February 29, 2012 in the amount of \$71,976.66.

IV. SERVICES RENDERED BY THE FIRM TO THE ESTATE

During the Application Period, the Firm frequently conferred with the Liquidating Trustee and his counsel regarding the status of matters, including the numerous discovery requests that the Liquidating Trustee has propounded, as well as overall litigation strategy. These communications often took the form of weekly status calls. These calls involved the Monitor and his counsel as well as the Liquidating Trustee and his counsel. Additionally, Geoffrey Varga and Ann Gittleman participated in an in-person meeting held in New York during the Application Period to discuss pending issues, the status of litigation matters and strategy going forward.

During this period, the Firm reviewed and commented on draft pleadings, bar orders and settlement agreements prepared by the Liquidating Trustee's counsel.

During this period, the Firm participated in conference calls with the Monitor's and the Liquidating Trustee's respective counsel to discuss potential claims by the Liquidating Trusts against U.S. Bank and strategy related thereto. The Firm reviewed, analyzed, and summarized extensive documents related to U.S. Bank and reviewed and analyzed pertinent issues in connection with potential claims against U.S. Bank.

During this period, the Firm participated in meetings and conference calls with the Monitor's and the Liquidating Trustee's respective counsels to discuss the strategy with respect

to potential litigation and assess the possible claims against Marshall & Ilsley Bank ("M&I"). In addition to these meetings, the Firm reviewed work product and a draft complaint from counsel to the Liquidating Trustee in regards to potential litigation against M&I. The Firm also reviewed M&I's motion to dismiss in order to assist the Liquidating Trustee with his response to the motion.

During the Application Period, the Firm prepared monthly fee statements for submission to the Liquidating Trustee and U.S. Trustee as contemplated by the Plan and Liquidating Trust Agreements. Also as contemplated by the Plan and Liquidating Trust Agreements, the Firm prepared and submitted its third post-confirmation fee application and appeared telephonically at a hearing on the same.

V. ALLOWANCE AND EVALUATION OF SERVICES RENDERED BY THE FIRM

Section 330(a) of the Bankruptcy Code provides, in relevant part:

- (a)(1) After notice to the parties in interest and the United States trustee and a hearing, and subject to sections 326, 328, and 329, the court may award to a trustee, an examiner, a professional person employed under Section 327 or 1103—
 - (A) reasonable compensation for actual, necessary services rendered by the trustee, examiner, professional person, or attorney and by any paraprofessional person employed by any such person; and
 - (B) reimbursement for actual, necessary expenses.
- The court may, on its own motion or on the motion of the United States Trustee, the United States Trustee for the District or Region, the trustee for the estate, or any other party in interest, award compensation that is less than the amount of compensation that is requested.
- In determining the amount of reasonable compensation to be awarded, the court shall consider the nature, the extent, and the

value of such services, taking into account all relevant factors, including-

- (A) the time spent on such services;
- (B) the rates charged for such services;
- (C) whether the services were necessary to the administration of, or beneficial at the time at which the service was rendered toward the completion of, a case under this title;
- (D) whether the services were performed within a reasonable amount of time commensurate with the complexity, importance, and nature of the problem, issue, or task addressed; and
- (E) whether the compensation is reasonable based on the customary compensation charged by comparably skilled practitioners in cases other than cases under this title.
- (4)(A) Except as provided in subparagraph (B), the court shall not allow compensation for
 - (i) unnecessary duplication of services; or
 - (ii) services that were not -
 - (I) reasonably likely to benefit the Debtors' estate; or
 - (II) necessary to the administration of the case.
 - (B) In a chapter 12 or chapter 13 case in which the Debtors is an individual, the court may allow reasonable compensation to the Debtors' attorney for representing the interests of the Debtors in connection with the bankruptcy case based on a consideration of the benefit and necessity of such services to the Debtors and the other factors set forth in this section.
- (5) The court shall reduce the amount of compensation awarded under this section by the amount of any final compensation awarded under §331, and, if the amount of such final compensation exceeds the amount of compensation awarded under this section, may order the return of the excess to the estate.

(6) Any compensation awarded for the preparation of a fee application shall be based on the level and skill reasonably required to prepare the application.

The Applicant believes that the requested fee of \$71,634.50 for 162.3 hours worked is reasonable considering the factors to be applied under 11 U.S.C. §330(a)(1) and the factors enumerated in *Johnson v. Georgia Highway Express, Inc.*, 488 F.2d 714 (5th Cir. 1974), made applicable to bankruptcy proceedings by *In re First Colonial Corp. of America*, 544 F.2d 1291 (5th Cir. 1977) as follows:

- a. The time and labor required;
- b. The novelty and difficulty of the questions presented;
- c. The skill required to perform the services properly;
- d. The preclusion of other employment due to acceptance of the case;
- e. The customary fee for similar work in the community;
- f. Whether the fee is fixed or contingent;
- g. Time limitations imposed by the client or by the circumstances;
- h. The amount involved and the results obtained;
- i. The experience, reputation and ability of the professional;
- j. The undesirability of the case;
- k. The nature and length of the professional relationship with the client;
- 1. Awards in similar cases;
- m. Whether the services were necessary to the administration of, or beneficial at the time at which the service was rendered toward the completion of, a case under this title; and
- n. Whether the services were performed within a reasonable amount of time commensurate with the complexity, importance, and nature of the problem, issue, or task addressed.

Consideration of Section 330(a) and The First Colonial Factors

The foregoing description of the services rendered by the Firm during the Application Period, together with the more detailed description of time expended and services rendered set forth in the attached exhibits, describe the nature and extent of the professional services rendered by the Firm during the Application Period for the benefit of the bankruptcy estates.

The Firm's professionals possess a great deal of experience along with the skills and knowledge necessary to professionally and efficiently handle many of the issues arising in these bankruptcy cases. Specifically, Geoffrey Varga, the Monitor, is a Member of the Firm and leads the Firm's Insolvency and Corporate Recovery practices in both New York and the Cayman Islands. He is a Chartered Accountant and has over 15 years of professional experience, the majority of which has been focused in the area of restructuring and insolvency. He is a licensed Canadian insolvency practitioner and has worked on large, international insolvency engagements in the United States, the Cayman Islands, Canada and New Zealand. Mr. Varga's average hourly billing rate during the Application Period was \$725.00.

Ann Gittleman is a Certified Public Accountant, Certified in Financial Forensics, and an attorney with over 10 years of experience in forensic accounting and litigation obtained from a Big 4 firm and a prominent New York City law firm. Ms. Gittleman has extensive experience in dealing with complex securities litigations, bankruptcy issues, financial reporting fraud, misappropriation of assets, auditor malpractice and internal investigations. Ms. Gittleman's average hourly billing rate during the Application Period was \$525.00.

Whenever possible, the Firm delegated work on the Monitor's legal matters to more junior personnel who have lower billing rates than Mr. Varga and Ms. Gittleman. Given the

foregoing, the average billing rate for the Firm's consulting services to the Monitor during the application period is \$428.75 per hour.

The services rendered by the Firm were necessary to achieve the Monitor's goals and responsibilities at the time the services were rendered. Moreover, the services performed by the Firm were performed within a reasonable amount of time commensurate with the complexity, importance, and nature of the problem, issue, or task addressed.

With regard to the remaining *First Colonial* factors, the Firm's fees were fixed; the Firm was not precluded from other employment due to the acceptance of representation on behalf of the Monitor in these cases; the cases were not undesirable; and the Firm, as Mr. Varga's direct employer, has previously assisted Mr. Varga in his various roles as court-appointed liquidator of offshore entities such as the Offshore Funds. Finally, the award requested by the Firm in this application is similar to awards made by this and other courts in similar cases.

REMAINDER OF PAGE LEFT BLANK

计算量量 化

on Harries

VI. CONCLUSION

For the foregoing reasons, the Firm respectfully requests that the Court enter an Order allowing and awarding the Firm, as an administrative expense, \$71,634.50 for services rendered by the Firm in connection with representation of the Monitor for the period of time from November 1, 2011 through February 29, 2012 and \$342.16 for reimbursement of actual and necessary expenses incurred by the Firm, for a total of \$71,976.66.

Dated: April 30, 2012

Respectfully submitted,

KINETIC PARTNERS (CAYMAN) LTD. Consultants for Geoffrey Varga, as the Liquidating Trust Monitor for Palm Beach Finance II, L.P.

Bv:

Geoffrey Varga
The Harbour Centre
42 North Church Street
P.O. Box 10387
Grand Cayman, KY1-1004
Cayman Islands
P: 345.623.9900

CERTIFICATE OF SERVICE

I HEREBY CERTIFY that a true and correct copy of the foregoing Application and all Exhibits thereto were served on the 30th day of April, 2012 via the Court's CM/ECF filing system to recipients registered to receive notices of electronic filings generated by CM/ECF for case no. 09-36379-BKC-PGH.

LEVINE KELLOGG LEHMAN
SCHNEIDER + GROSSMAN LLP
Local Counsel for Liquidating Trust Monitor for
Palm Beach Finance II, L.P.
201 South Biscayne Blvd.
Miami Center – 34th Floor
Miami, Florida 33131-4301
Telephone: 305.403.8788
Facsimile: 305.403.8789

By: /s/ Robin J. Rubens
Robin J. Rubens, Esq.
Florida Bar. No. 959413
E-mail: rjr@LKLlaw.com

 ${\bf \underline{Exhibit~1}}$ Summary of Professional Time

NAME (%)	THE RAYLES	TONES	
Ann E. Gittleman	\$525.00	74.2	\$38,955.00
Geoffrey E. Varga	\$725.00	24.4	\$17,690.00
Jenna Gordish	\$225.00	19.9	\$4,477.50
Kathryn Latti	\$240.00	43.8	\$10,512.00
	Totals:	162.3	\$71,634.50

Exhibit 2
Summary of Requested Reimbursement of Expenses

KINET (CPARTNERS D)	KPENSES :
Taxi	\$78.87
Lodging	\$263.29
Total:	\$342.16

Exhibit 3

Certification

Affidavit in Support of Certification

STATE OF NEW YORK)

COUNTY OF NEW YORK)

Geoffrey E. Varga, being duly sworn, deposes and says:

I am over the age of 18 years old and have personal knowledge of the matters set forth in this affidavit. I make this affidavit in support of the application (the "Application") for entry of an order, pursuant to 11 U.S.C. §§ 330, 331, 503(b)(2), allowing and awarding to Kinetic Partners (Cayman) Ltd. (the "Firm"), as an administrative expense, fees and costs incurred in connection with the Firm's representation of the Monitor, as such term is defined in the Plan.

I am the person at the Firm responsible for the representation of the Monitor in these cases and, as such, I am designated by the Firm as the professional with responsibility in these cases for compliance with the "Guidelines for Fee Applications for Professionals in the Southern District of Florida in Bankruptcy Cases" (the "Guidelines").

I have read the Application. The Application complies with the Guidelines, and the fees and expenses sought fall within the Guidelines, except as may be specifically noted in this Affidavit and described in the Application.

The fees and expenses sought are billed at rates and in accordance with practices customarily employed by the Firm and generally accepted by the Firm's clients.

In seeking reimbursement for the expenditures described on Exhibit 2, the Firm is seeking reimbursement only for the actual expenditure and has not marked up the actual cost to provide a profit or to recover the amortized cost of investment in staff time or equipment or capital outlay.

In seeking reimbursement for any service provided by a third party, the Firm is seeking reimbursement only for the amount actually paid by the Firm to the third party.

The following are the variances with the provisions of the Guidelines, the date of each court order approving the variance, and the justification for the variance: Not applicable.

FURTHER AFFIANT SAITH NAUGHT.

GEOFFREY E. VARGA

Sworn to before me this 37 th day of April, 2012

Notary Public

IDALIA M. COLLADO
NOTARY PUBLIC, State of New York
No. 01CO5042232
Qualified in County of Queens
Commission Expires April, 20

Composite Exhibit 4

Contemporaneous Time and Expense Records

OUT TO TENDEN OF THE CONTRACT COLLECTION OF THE CONTRACT OF TH	(23.00	r	A	Lindagou Consonid-Centeral	1107167111
Wheeler and the for the common transfer that the property of the common transfer the common transfer to the common	20,020	2 2	AEG	Lingation Consumo General	11/23/2011
Traversed and provided continues of the	223.00	٠	VEG	-	1107/57/1
_	225.00	┰	JGO	-	11/22/2011
	225.00	+	JGO	:=	11/22/2011
	525,00	+-	AGG	F	11/22/2011
Reviewed file and Jambor and Flynn's deposition for review of the M&I complaint.	525.00	+-	AEG		11/22/2011
420.00 Reviewed and provided comments to counted on Kinetic's Third Application for Fees and Expenses.	525.00	080	AEG	11 Fee Preparation	11/22/2011
Final review and provided comments on final version of 3rd post confirmation see application	240.00	┰	2	11 Fee Preparation	11/21/2011
	240.00	1	Ę,	Litigation Consulting-General	11/21/2011
362.50 Weekly call to discuss various topics re Rigation status, adversary deadline/fulling agreements	725,00	0.50	GV	Litigation Consulting-General	11/21/2011
Trustee (1.5); Reviewed Matrix and compared to client listing for affidavit (.8)				The second secon	
_	505.00	-	AFG.	_1	1101001
	40.00	_	2		11/18/2011
192.00 Review of Petters and Palm Beach docket filings	240.00	0.80	Ē	11/18/2011 Litigation Consulting-Petters	11/18/201
2/0.U0 г гараяно ботесция из это раж солитивнот не ерфиками в начаще си переделение в политивности и получение политивности не в применение политивности и	40.00	2.40	Ē	11/1//2011 Fee Preparation	ועשו/ רובר
	3	٠		20119191	
427.00 Proceing to Universe Systems of Francisco and Construction and Cons	270.00	3 2		Hoarlon Consulting Ceneral	11/17/2011
Inced the state and determine the Deservation of the formula (A) review of the least of the property of the pr	20.00	+	5	This is the interest of the in	11/10/2011
various tasks and forensic assignments on the Palm Beach case (5)	3	+-	3	1	1111000
Read the 'Palm	225.00	-+	GO	Litigation Consulting-General	11/16/201
	725.00	-	GV	Litigation Consulting-General	11/16/2011
315.00 Review and provided comments on Kinetic's Third Post Confirmation (se application (.6)	525.00	0.60	AEG SEA	11 Fee Preparation	11/16/2011
1,156.00 Emails with counsel discussing document dalabase/access, (d); Review and provide comments on Kinetic's retention application (d); Reviewed and provided comments on the application to employ Kinetic as torarisic accountant to Trustee and vertous supporting documents, provided comments to counsel, (1)	525.00	2.20	AEG	11/16/2011 Litigation Consulting-General	11/16/201
Paim Beach with team and for	525.00	136	AEG	Litigation Consulting-General	11/16/2011
Review of specific transactions in 2008 to Nationwide/Enchanted	240.00	+-	3	Litigation Consulting-M&I	11/15/2011
787.50 Reviewed fees for the Trust Monitor and Kinetic and provided comments	525,00	٠-	AEG	-	11/15/2011
	525.00	-	AEG	Litigation Consulting-General	11/15/2011
Review of settlement motions and other related filings provided by coursel	240,00	-	K.2	Litigation Consulting-General	11/14/2011
	240.00	Н	KI2	Litigation Consulting-General	11/14/2011
Debrief from B&D meeting.	725.00	\rightarrow	QV V	Litigation Consulting-US Bank	11/14/2011
	525.00	-	AEG	Litigation Consulting-General	11/14/2011
	525.00	┪	AFG	Litigation Consulting-General	11/14/2011
	240.00	-+	G	Litigation Consulting-Petters	11/11/2011
	24000	7	3	Eee Prenaration	11/10011
	240.00	+	Ž.Z	Litration Consulting-General	11/11/2011
180.00 Meeting to update status of Palm Beach claims	225.00	88	ğ	Litigation Consulting-General	11/11/2011
1,522.50 Review notes from meeting to discuss with learn (x), Meeting with learn to discuss meeting with instead and tolkow up teams. (x0), Fariopsed on meeting cast with team (x4), deeped party-learner of PB, (1.7).	625.00	2.90	AEG		11/11/201
	240.00	0,60	2	Lttigation Consulting-General	11/10/2011
2,175.00 Meeting with Trustee to discuss various case matters	725.00	300 7	GV	Litigation Consulting-General	11/10/2011
1,575.00 Meeting with Trustee, counsel and our counsel to discuss the Palm Beach benitrupley and related Rigation.	525.00	3,00	AEG	Litigation Consulting-General	11/10/2011
Review file to prepare for meeting with Trustee and counsel.	525.00	-	AEG	Litigation Consulting-General	11/9/201
Call with Trustee to general file matters	725.00	_	ହ	Litigation Consulting-General	11/2/2011
225.00 Reviewed the Heines Court Order dated 10.27.11 and Memorandum	22500	-+	S.	t trigation Consulting-General	11/1/2011
Pees Description	Rate		Staff	Category	Date
Milego Parmers (Cayman) Fro November 2011 Decail Hills Citates fro February	2				

	28,283,00		L			
			-			
315.00 Reviewed numerous emeits from counsel and Monitor discussing the types of lawsuits to be fixed.	315.00	525.00	0.60	AEG	11/30/2011 Litigation Consulting General	11/30/201
840.00 Reviewed numerous filings on the Bankruptcy cass.	840.00	525.00	1.60	AEG	11 Administration	11/30/201
144,00 Reviewed final M&I complaint filed in US Bankruptcy court	144.00	240.00	0.60	Ē	1 Litigation Consulting M&I	11/29/2011
585.00 (Reed, summerized and archived documents related to	585.00	225.00	2.60	560	1 Litigation Consulting - Petters	11/29/201
472.50 Reviewed the final filed M&I complaint to be filed under seet. (.5) Reviewed various emails from counsel disputsing the case. (.3)	472,50	525.00	0.90	AEG	11/29/2011 Litigation Consulting M&I	11/29/201
as related to claims made in the M&I complaint (5)	İ					
240.00 [Review of various emails on comments for M&I complaint (.3), related discussion with A. Gittleman on comments (.2) research into	240.00	240.00	1.8	Ē	11/28/2011 Litigation Consulting M&I	11/28/201
	145.00	725.00	0.20	GV	1 Litigation Consulting M&I	11/28/201
with K. Latti to discuss M&I comments. (.2)		l	ŀ			
420,00 Various email with counsel to discuss M&I complaint and comments. (.3): Reviewed the to address counteers comments on the wall complaint. (-3): Various email with counsel to discuss M&I complaint and comments.	420.00	525.00	0.80	AEG	11/28/2011 Litigation Consulting M&I	11/28/201
360.00 Reviewed the insurance complaint and provided comments	360,00	240.00	1.50	Š	11/25/2011 Litigation Consulting Insurance (KL2	11/25/201
240.00 Reviewed the M&I compleint and provided comments	240.00	240,00	1.00	Š	11 Litigation Consulting M&I	11/25/201
787,50 Reviewed the Insurance complaint and provided comments to counsel	787,50	525.00	1.50	AEG	11 Litigation Consulting Insurance (AEG	11/25/201
480,00 (Reviewed the M&I complaint and provided comments	480,00	240.00	2.00	2	1 Litigation Consulting M&I	11/23/2011
192.00 Final review and tie out of numbers in fee application	192.00	240.00	0.80	<u> </u>	1 Fee Preparation	11/23/201
337.50 Read and reviewed the M&I Complaint	337.50	1.50 225.00	1.50	JGO C	11/23/2011 Litigation Consulting M&I	11/23/201

00	4,207.00	Total				
72.50 Emails re Claims	72.5	725.00	0.10	GV	11/28/2011 Realisation of Assets	11/28/2011
145.00 Discussions re clawback actions	145.0	725.00	0.20	GV	11/23/2011 Realisation of Assets	11/23/2011
96.00 Review of tolling agreement for	96.0	240.00	0.40	KL2	11/22/2011 Realisation of Assets	11/22/2011
72.50 Review of status	72.5	725.00	0.10	GV	11/22/2011 Realisation of Assets	11/22/2011
217.50 Discussions re clawback actions	217.5	725.00	0.30	GV	11/21/2011 Realisation of Assets	11/21/2011
1,050.00 Reviewed various filings in the US Bankruptcy court prought by PBFII.	1,050.0	525.00	2.00	AEG	Realisation of Assets	11/18/2011
	96.00	240.00	0.40	KL2	Realisation of Assets	11/16/2011
145.00 Comment re retainer agreement J. Eaton	145.00	725.00	0.20	GV	11/14/2011 Realisation of Assets	11/14/2011
210.00 Reviewed the settlement with Jupiter Leen Challenge	210.00	525.00	0.40	AEG	11/11/2011 Realisation of Assets	11/11/2011
725.00 Clawback discussion and analysis	725.00	725.00	1.00	GV	11/10/2011 Realisation of Assets	11/10/2011
145.00 Clawback memo review	145.00	725.00	0.20	GV	11/9/2011 Realisation of Assets	11/9/2011
1,087.50 Travel to/from Dallas re PBMS; settlement meeting with PBMS	1,087.50	725.00	1.50	GV	11/3/2011 Realisation of Assets	11/3/2011
	145.00	725.00	0.20	GV	Realisation of Assets	11/2/2011
Description	Foes	Rate	Time	Staff	Category	Date
Kinetic Partners (Cayman) Ltd November 2011 Detail Time Entries (PB II Estate Only)	/man) Ltd i	Partners (Cay	Kinetic			İ

1	a	
	Partners (C	
	يد	
	yman)	
ļ	5	
ı	•	
ı	÷	co
I	Ř	Š
	<u> </u>	Ž
	₽.	₫
	2	
Į	8	_
ì	3	
	ø	
	8	
	F	
	날	
	묾	
	m	
	2	
	重	
	E	
	ď	
	ᇣ	
	Ē	

		-	\mid			
	6,331.50	Total	\vdash			
review of finalized fee application (3)		0.80 240.00	0.8	Z.	12/27/2011 Fee Preparation	12/27/2011
210.00 Reviewed recent Paim Beach linings received from course.	T	0.40 525.00	0.4	AEG	12/27/2011 Litigation Consulting-General	12/27/2011
787.50 Reviewed the Petters Sub Con Trial Transcripts and summary from counses.	Ī	1.50 525.00	1.5	AEG	12/23/2011 Litigation Consulting-Petters	12/23/2011
525.00 Reviewed file in preparation for call. (.5); Call with counsel and i rustae to provide an update on the case. (.5)		.00 525.00	1.0	AEG	12/22/2011 Litigation Consuling-General	12/22/2011
217.50 Discussion re Petters case status and subcon		0.30 725.00	0.3	GV	12/19/2011 Litigation Consulting-Petters	12/19/2011
157.50 Reviewed email from counsel re recent hings.		0.30 525.00	0.30	AEG	12/15/2011 Litigation Consulting-General	12/15/2011
157.50 Reviewed email from counsel re recent fatigs.		0.30 525.00	0.31	AEG	12/14/2011 Litigation Consulting-General	12/14/2011
120,00 Prepared and finalized monthly fee invoice summanes		0.50 240.00	0.5	Ķ.	12/12/2011 Fee Preparation	12/12/2011
525.00 Reviewed the file to prepare for call (.5) Call with I rustee and course to discuss the status of the case, (.3)		525.00	1.00	AEG	12/12/2011 Litigation Consulting-General	12/12/2011
420.00 Reviewed the Palm Beach Fee Application and provided comments		525.00	0.80	AEG	12/12/2011 Fee Preparation	12/12/2011
Į		_				
1,4 1/30 reverses are case to seen and seen and correspondence from counsed discussing the case law and associated case filings. (1.4); from occlusing dependant, (2) Reviewed mail correspondence from counsed discussing the case law and associated case filings. (1.4);		2/0 525,00	- 2	AEG	12/6/2011 Lingation Consulting-General	12/6/2011
98,00 Review of Peters docket of ecent tings as emailed by course! (4) Reviewed the request	T	0.40 240.00	0.4	2	12/5/2011 Litigation Consulting-Petters	12/5/2011
1						
Update call with A. Gittleman to discuss Friday call summary (.3), meeting with ream to go over next steps and assignments (.o), enter the province of the control of the c	528.00	240.00	2.20	2	12/5/2011 Laigation Consulting-General	12/5/2011
LKLSG (9), update meeting with team to discuss libgation status (6)				3	Corcord Lagaron Consoning road	(2)072011
Read the Judge Hurley's Order on Perimen v. Wells Fargo Bank, N.A., Case No. 9:10-cv-81612, including summary provided by	337.50	225.00	1.50	3	Pinetion Consulting Mari	13/50011
Update meeting on the status of the case with team. (-6); Update call with Kate to decuse status of the case and call with counsel lass week (-3)	472.50	525.00	0.90	AEG	12/5/2011 Litigation Consulting-General	12/5/2011
Weekly meeting with counsel to discuss various updates to the case and suciety with linguistics builty to share with Kinetic team (.1)	168.00	240.00	0.70	Ē	12/2/2011 Lttlgation Consulting-General	12/2/2011
Description	Fees	t	Time	Staff	Category	Date
Kinetic Partners (Cayman) Ltd December 2011 Detail Time Entries (PB & ii)	etic Partners (Car	줐				l !

50	1,928.50	Total				
145.00 Update on clawback actions	145.0	725.00	0.20	GV	12/19/2011 Realisation of Assets	12/19/201
315.00 Reviewed the excel spreadsheet prepared by counsel hacking the campaca actions most	315.0	525.00	0.60	AEG	12/13/2011 Litigation support	12/13/201
-12	120.00	240.00	0.50	<u>~</u> 2	1 Realisation of Assets	12/12/201
	145.0	725,00	0.20	GV	1 Realisation of Assets	12/12/201
120.00 Review of recent semements in case as emained by countries	120.0	240.00	0.50	Ē,	12/9/2011 Realisation of Assets	12/9/201
120.00 Review of emails regarding	120.0	240.00	0.50	2	1 Litigation Consulting-General	12/9/201
72.50 Emails reconstruction (daim)	72.5	725.00	0.10	GV	1 Realisation of Assets	12/8/201
review	288.0	240.00	1.20	KL2	12/2/2011 Litigation Consulting-General	12/2/201
	2000	240.00	1.20	Ĩ	12/1/2011 Litigation Constituing-General N.2	12/1/201
315,00 Regrewed HSDC Ining and Unscussions	315.0	525.00	0.60	AEG	1 Litigation Consulting-General	12/1/2011
HAMILICEAN HOUSE TO A STATE OF THE STATE OF	Fees	Rate	Time	Staff	Category	Date
Kinetic Pariners (Cayman) Ltd October 2011 Detail time Citures to the South Store	yman) Ltd C	Partners (Ca	Kinetic			
Schedule D		·	:			

13,964,50	Total	_			
			-		
292.50 Researched Polaroid/Ritchie matter	225.00	1.30	JGO	Litigation Consulting-Petters	1/30/2012
382,50 Continued reading the M&I Motion to Dismiss with exhibits (1), prepared listing of tasks to be completed (7)	225.00	1.70	JGO	Litigation Consulting M&I	1/30/2012
Emails re MTD	725.00	0.10	ତ୍ୟ	Litigation Consulting M&I	1/30/2012
580.00 (Call with counsel re potential itigation	725.00	0.80	GV	Litigation Consulting - General	1/30/2012
210.00 Reviewed emails from counsel discussing filings for today in the Bankruptcy Court	525.00	0.40	AEG	Litigation Consulting - General	1/30/2012
	525.00	0.30	AEG	Litigation Consulting M&I	1/30/2012
72.00 Finished review of M&I MTD and prepared list of comments/questions	240.00	0.30	K12	Litigation Consulting M&I	1/27/2012
225.00 Read the M6I, Motion to Olsmiss with exhibits	225.00	1.00	JGO	Litigation Consulting M&I	1/27/2012
72.50 Emails with HL re potential litigation	725.00	0.10	GV	Litigation Consulting - General	1/27/2012
72.50 Emails re , review of docs	725.00	0.10	GV	Litigation Consulting-US Bank	1/27/2012
630.00 Review detailed email from counsel discussing	525.00	1.20	AEG	Litigation Consulting-Petters	1/27/2012
48.00 Review of the docket for updates to case	240.00	0.20	F.2	Litigation Consulting - General	1/26/2012
435.00 Calls with media re M&I liftgation	725.00	0.60	GV	Utigation Consulting M&I	1/25/2012
210.00 Reviewed docket updates from counsel	525.00	0.40	AEG	Litigation Consulting-Petters	1/25/2012
105.00 Review emails from counsel re potential litigation and questions	525.00	0.20	AEG	Litigation Consulting - General	1/25/2012
1	240.00	0.80	K.2	Litigation Consulting M&I	1/24/2012
435.00 Call with Trustee and counsel to discuss updates on settlements and ongoing fligation matters	725.00	0.60	GV	Litigation Consulting - General	1/24/2012
COUNSE! (6)	060.00		'n	1/24/2012 Cingalion Consumity - General	1124/2012
143,00 I Citalis will revesion site of courses and the file in representation for net with Trustee and courses (1). Call with the Trustee and	625.00	2	S	Lingation Consuming-US Bank	1/23/2012
11E OF CHARLES PORTION OF STREET	325.00	2	2 2	Ciplanous Consolination estates	102/02/1
210 Ol Besteward that droket brouded by counsel	20.00		AFG	Litigation Consulting Politics	1/2/02/12
144 Ol Bacis in review 181 MTD	240.00	3 2	2 2	1/20/2012 Litigation Consulting Mail	1/20/2012
06 ON Designated Technology, related trialies a	20.00		3 0	Lugaion Consumng - General	2102/02/1
2	92.00		À	1/20/2012 Lingation Consuming Madi	1/20/2012
Meeting with team to discuss recent updates to case and various	240.00	8	Š.	Litigation Consulting - General	1/19/2012
Read Defendants' motion to dismiss complaint and prepared at	225.00	: 8	jo	Litigation Consulting M&I	1/19/2012
	225.00	-8	jeo	Litigation Consulting - General	1/19/2012
217.50 Review of M&I MTD	725.00	0.30	GV	Litigation Consulting M&I	1/19/2012
315.00 Review of the Petters docket from counsel.	525.00	0.60	AEG	Litigation Consulting-Petters	1/19/2012
525.00 Meeting with team to discuss updates on the case and various fitigations	525,00	1.00	AEG	Litigation Consulting - General	1/19/2012
	725.00	0.10	GV	Litigation Consulting M&I	1/18/2012
Call with investor re US B	725.00	0.20	GV	Litigation Consulting-US Bank	1/18/2012
	725.00	9	Q)	Litigation Consulting-US Bank	1/16/2012
Call with Trustee to d	725.00	0.90	GV.	Litination Consulting-US Bank	1/13/2012
262.50 Call W DUS Bank related matters	525.00	0.50	AEG	Litigation Consulting - General	1/13/2012
5/7.50) Prepare for meeting with interectioneer notes (.2), meeting with interee and counser to discuss updates with case and visyoning matters (.9).	525.00	1.10	AEG	Litigation Consulting - General	1/13/2012
217.50 Call to counsel re investor and potential kitgation	725.00	0.30	GV	Litigation Consulting - General	1/12/2012
145.00 Review of MB memo re US Bank	725.00	0.20	GV		1/12/2012
240.00 Prepared monthly fee Invoices	240.00	1.08	Ę,	Fee Preparation	1/11/2012
	525,00	0.80	AEG	Fee Preparation	1/11/2012
Review of	240.00	0.50	RZ	Litigation Consutting-US Bank	1/10/2012
3	725.00	0.40	GV	Litigation Consulting US Bank	1/10/2012
145.00 Counsel provided updates re talks with prelated discussions	725.00	0.20	GV	Litigation Consulting-US Bank	1/9/2012
192.00 Conlinued review of the Petters sub-con trial transcript	240.00	0.80	KL2	Litigation Consulting-Petters	1/6/2012
507.50 Weekly status call to discuss various matters on the case	725.00	0.70	GV	Litigation Consulting - General	1/6/2012
matters (.7)	04.00	Ę	AEG	176/2012 Lingarion Consuling - General	7107/01/
200 Of Designar in order to the relief of other parts of the California and relief of the california and parts of	240.50	3 6		Lingaron Consumy-reners	7107711
198 AN Deans review of the Dellace sub-one trial transcript	200	3	5	The state of the s	350
	1		YEST	Category	

				Kinetic Par	riners (Cavma	n) Ltd Janu	Kinetic Partners (Cavman) Ltd January 2012 Detail Time Entries (PB II Estate Only)
_	Date	Category	Staff	Time	Rate	Fees	Description
_	1/3/2012	1/3/2012 Realisation of Assets	GV	0.20	725.00	145.00	145,00 Review of letter re Vennes and related emails
_	1/6/2012	1/6/2012 Realisation of Assets	GV	0.20	725.00	145.00	145.00 Clawback updates
	1/11/2012	1/11/2012 Realisation of Assets	GV	1.40	725.00	1015.00	1015 00 Discussions/emails re
	1/13/2012	1/13/2012 Realisation of Assets	GV	0.30	725,00	217.50	217.50 Update on clawback actions
_	1/18/2012	Realisation of Assets	AEG	0.40	525.00	210.00	210.00 Reviewed Kelly's objection
_,	1/20/2012	Realisation of Assets	AEG	0.30	525.00	157.50	157.50 Reviewed the PBF II Claims register for objections to claims.
_,	1/20/2012	1/20/2012 Realisation of Assets	KI2	0.60	240,00	144.00	144.00 Review of Petters objection
,	1/20/2012	1/20/2012 Realisation of Assets	JGO	1.00	225.00	225.00	225,00 Read Kelley's objection ((.5), reviewed claims in PBF III
_	1/23/2012	1/23/2012 Realisation of Assets	AEG	0.60	525.00	315.00	315.00 Continued review of claims filed into the PBFII estate
	1/24/2012	1/24/2012 Realisation of Assets	GV	0.30	725.00	217.50	217.50 Update on clawbacks
_					_		
_					Total	2 791 50	

263.29 Hotel Charge re Smnns Moss mediation 32.70 Text to Airport to Simms Moss mediation 30.00 Text to MiA airport to Simms Moss mediation 35.5 Text to Bernstein Literatus US Bank 7.92 Text to Ourn Emanuel to discuss US Bank Literatus 342.16	otal Expenses	1			
1-1-1-1-1		2			Ì
			1	I I I GRUP I BROWN BITY/COST OF PARKING	1107/8/0
.1 11	1	1	s č		
			5	Train/Plane/Ferry/Cost of Parking	8/9/2011
	_	-	ହ	Train/Plane/Ferry/Cost of Parking	725/201
			GV	I Train/Plane/Ferry/Cost of Parking	7/24/2011
	L		GV.	Accomodation	1124/2011
	- 1	- 100			Evnancos
	•	T 20 50			1
72.50 Howse settlement issues and emails	725.00	0.10	ହ		2/29/2012
217.50 F&B settlement docs; Howse matters	725.00	0.30	ବ		3/28/2012
725.00 Call re complaint and related matters; review of relevant docs	725.00	1.00	ତ୍		2/28/2012
1,260.00 Review the MSI complaint in preparation for call (1.0), Call to discuss the MSI complaint, L.S), Uraned email with follow up (3)	525.00	2.40	AEG.		71071970
In alls re nowse mediation	/25.00	0.20	G	CILRIGATION CONSUITING GENERAL	710717
	323.00	200	700		7107470
457 60 Constant the declaration from connecti	300	2	200	of singling Concession	3
	725 00	0.20	Q.		2/22/2012
	525.00	0.40	AEG .		2/21/2012
	525.00	0.60	AEG		2/21/2012
1,050.00 Used Court Call to hear part of court hearing on various motions against the Trustee for Atradius and other adversary actions	525.00	2.00	AEG	2 Litigation Consulting-Insurance Companies	2/17/2012
	240.00	0.20	Š	2 Fee Preparation	216/201
_	/25.00	0.80	GV.		710/01/2
status update for the case. (.b), call with US counsel to discuss various				-	
540.00 Review tile and recently tiled cocuments to prepare for call with interest and countries. (-0), cell with interest and countries.	525.00	ē	An	2/10/2012 Lingation Consuming- General	210/201
the state of the s	240.00	- 5	Ī	- COLUMN TO THE	
Einel under to imprise based on AEG comments and correspondent	24000	2	23	2 Fee Preparation	2/15/2012
157.50 Review and provided comments on the proposed order granting Monitor's professional fees	525.00	030	AEG	21Fee Preparation	115/201
on 2022. (3)		_			
_	525.00	0.70	ÆG		2/15/2012
	525.00	0.40	AEG	2 Litigation Consulting M81	2/15/2012
Review of mediation doc for Howse	725.00	0.10	ð		2/14/2012
472.50 Review our tee application for the ree application flearing. (.3); Dieseg into court can for a nearing on the ree application. (.5)	525.00	0.90	AEG		2/14/2012
Emails with counsel to discuss	525.00	0.40	AFG		214/2012
	525.00	0.10	AEG	•	7107/10
COCO (Linguage in High sense in the sense of provide to consiste the sense in the s	240.00	2 2	1		2132012
Departed monthly time elimination fraction to provide to provide the la	3 20.00	ŝ	5 9		200
	775	3	2		2/12/2012
Reviewed	525.00	200	AF G		2/13/2012
	725.00	020	9	2 Liffoation Consulting- General	2/11/2012
72.50 Updates on claim	725.00	0.10	ତ	2/10/2012 Litigation Consulting-US Bank	710201
157.50 Emails with counsel and Trustee discussing potential action	525.00	0.30	AEG	2l Litigation Consulting-General	2/10/2012
192.00 Review of complaint against Atradius and Atradius' MTD	240.00	0.80	KI2		2/9/2012
420.00 Reviewed the complaint filed by Ritchie Capital against law firm and related email correspondence to GV	525.00	0.80	AEG	2 Litigation Consulting- General	2/9/2012
Review of letter to	240.00	0.40	KI2	2 Liligation Consulting-US Bank	2/8/201
Mediation signoff and related emails	725.00	0.20	GV	2 Uligation Consulting- General	2/8/201
105.00 Review email from Investor re potential litigation	525.00	0.20	AEG	2/8/2012 Litigation Consulting-US Barik	2/8/201
96.00 Correspondence of allocation of monies received for December invoices	240.00	0.40	2	2 Fee Preparation	2/1/2012
145.00 Email correspondence re USB	725.00	0.20	GV	2 Litigation Consulting-US Bank	2/7/201
210.00 {Call with Trustee and counsel to discuss US Bank.	525.00	0.40	AEG	2 Litigation Consulting-US Bank	2/7/2012
c	725,00	0.60	GV	2 Litigation Consulting- General	2/6/2012
with Trustee and counsel to receive an update on the case and related litigations. (.6)					
1,155.00 Review the letter to (.6); Continued to review (.6); Continued to review	525.00	220	AEG	2/6/2012 Litigation Consulting- General	2/6/201
Review of letter to	240.00	0.70	Ĉ	2 Litigation Consulting-Petters	2/3/2012
	725.00	0,50	S		2/3/2012
	525.00	0.30	A C	ZILINGATION CONSULTING-US BANK	2102012
CZUC IE mail conespondente, realectrevex and approval of December Involve	240,00	200	1		7107017
and anamial of Danamhar in a	720.00	2 0	5 6		200000
17 CO (Legariterent di una do de) i alia sa instala.	20.00	2 6	2	2 Lingaron Consulting Patters	20000
analysis	22.00	2 2 2 2 2	AEG.	21 libration Consultant Determ	CHOCOCO
Attended to litination undate emails	77.00	2 6	2	oll single Consulting Consult	340
420.00 Review and provided comments on counsel's letter to (4.5) Review proof of claims filed in PGW. (.3)	525.00	080	AEG		2/1/2012
Rate Fees Description	Rate	Time	Staff	Category	8

ъ.	
an)	
Ĕ	
ī	
Ē	ć
Ē.	
E	9
ğ	C
匰	
Ħ	
E E	
Ē	
100	
層	
Ē	
ΙĊ	

	2,801.50	Total		_		
192.00 Review of responses to KBC MTD's in preparation for court hearing on 2/17	192.00	240.00	0.80	K.	2/16/2012 Realisation of Assets	2/16/2012
actual filings				_		
72.00 Review of email from counsel re: Christian Charities MTD and related complaint against and further review of	72.00	240.00	0.30	2	2/15/2012 Realisation of Assets	2/15/2012
420.00 Review more filings from clawback defendants in order to monitor the docket.	420.00	525,00	0.80	AEG	2/15/2012 Realisation of Assets	2/15/2012
(2)						
96.00 Research into missing payment from Marcum (.2), related correspondence with Marcum on missing payment	96.00	240.00	0.40	S S	2/14/2012 Fee Preparation	2/14/2012
72.50 Review of mediation doc for Howse; emails re KBC decision	72.50	725.00	0.10	GV	2/14/2012 Litigation Consulting- General	2/14/2012
420,00 Reviewed emails from counsel re recent filings and summary of filings.	420,00	525.00	0.80	AEG	2/14/2012 Realisation of Assets	2/14/2012
145.00 Attended to clawback matters and KBC issue	145.00	725.00	0.20	GV	2/13/2012 Realisation of Assets	2/13/2012
(.3)						
577.50 Reviewed complaints, motions to dismiss for clawback claims. (.8); related email correspondence with counsel.	577.50	525.00	1.10	AEG	2/13/2012 Realisation of Assets	2/13/2012
157.50 Reviewed the KBC motion to dismiss and emails with counsel	157.50	525,00	0.30	AEG	2/13/2012 Realisation of Assets	2/13/2012
120.00 Review of adversary compleints against KBC	120.00	240.00	0.50	KL2	2/9/2012 Realisation of Assets	2/9/2012
With Admiral (.2)						
240.00 Review of documents produced previously by Admiral (1997) and (1997). (8), correspondence	240.00	240.00	1.00	<u> </u>	2/9/2012 Litigation Consulting-General	2/9/2012
144.00 Review of KBC motion to dismiss	144.00	240.00	0.60	KL2	2/8/2012 Realisation of Assets	2/8/2012
145.00 Clawback update and related discussions	145.00	725.00	0.20	GV	2/6/2012 Realisation of Assets	2/6/2012
Description	Fees	Rate	Time	Staff	Category	Date
Kinetic Partners (Cayman) Ltd February 2012 Detail Time Entries (PB Estate Only)	<u>ıan) Ltd Febr</u>	tners (Cayn	Kinetic Par			