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With regard to the remaining First Colonial factors, the Firm’s fees were fixed; the Firm
was not precluded from other employment due to the acceptance of representation on behalf of
the Monitor in these cases; the cases were not undesirable; and the Firm, as Mr. Varga’s direct
employer, has previously assisted Mr, Varga in his various roles as court-appointed liquidator of
offshore entities such as the Offshore Funds. Finally, the award requested by the Firm in this
application is similar to awards made by this and other courts in similar cases.

VI. CONCLUSION

For the foregoing reasons, the Firm respectfully requests that the Court enter an
Order allowing and awarding the Firm, as an administrative expense, $77,743.50 for services
rendered by the Firm in connection with representation of the Monitor for the period of time
from November 1, 2013 through February 28, 2014 and $751.89 for reimbursement of actual and
necessary expenses incurred by the Firm, for a total of $78,495.39.
Dated: April 25, 2014
Respectfully submitted,

KINETIC PARTNERS (CAYMAN) LTD.
Consultants for Geoffrey Varga, as the
Liquidating Trust Monitor for Palm Beach
Finance II, L.P.

By: 6/

Geoffrey Varga

The Harbour Centre

42 North Church Street
P.O. Box 10387

Grand Cayman, KY1-1004
Cayman Islands

P: 345.623.9900
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CERTIFICATE OF SERVICE

I HEREBY CERTIFY that: (1) pursuant to the Order Authorizing Professionals
Employed by the Liquidating Trustee and Monitor to Provide Notice of Their Post Confirmation
Fee Applications For Compensation in Summary Form [ECF NO. 648], a Notice of Filing,
which will include a Certificate of Service of the foregoing, will be filed at a later date; and (2) a
true and correct copy of this Application and all exhibits thereto were served on the 25th day of
April, 2014 via the court's CM/ECF electronic mail to all recipients registered to receive

electronic filings for this case.

By:_/s/ Robin J. Rubens
Robin J. Rubens, Esq.
Florida Bar. No. 959413
E-mail: rjr@IL.KI.SG.com
LEVINE KELLOGG LEHMAN
SCHNEIDER + GROSSMAN LLP
Local Counsel for Liquidating Trust
Monitor
201 South Biscayne Blvd.
Miami Center — 22nd Floor
Miami, Florida 33131-4301
Telephone: 305.403.8788
Facsimile: 305.403.8789
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Exhibit 1

Summary of Professional Time

NAME [ AVG. | HOURS | AMOUNT
_ RATE | '

Ann E. Gittleman $595.00 52.10 $30,999.50
Geoffrey E. Varga $750.00 34.60 $25,950.00
Jenna Gordish $295.00 20.70 $6,106.50
Kathryn Latti $375.00 31,00 $11,625.00
Janelle Murphy $245.00 12.50 $3,062.50
Totals: 150.90 | $77,743.50
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Exhibit 2

Summary of Requested Reimbursement of Expenses

KINETIC EXPENSES
Sundry Expenses $14.95
Travel/Airt/Ferry/Park $736.94

Total: $751.89
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Exhibit 3

Certification
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Affidavit in Support of Certification

STATE OF NEW YORK )
) SS:
COUNTY OF NEW YORK )

Geoffrey E. Varga, being duly sworn, deposes and says:

I am over the age of 18 years old and have personal knowledge of the matters set forth in
this affidavit. I make this affidavit in support of the application (the “Application”) for entry of
an order, pursuant to 11 U.S.C. §§ 330, 331, 503(b)(2), allowing and awarding to Kinetic
Partners (Cayman) Ltd. (the “Firm”), as an administrative expense, fees and costs incurred in
connection with the Firm’s representation of the Monitor, as such term is defined in the Plan.

I am the person at the Firm responsible for the representation of the Monitor in these
cases and, as such, I am designated by the Firm as the professional with responsibility in these
cases for compliance with the “Guidelines for Fee Applications for Professionals in the Southern
District of Florida in Bankruptcy Cases” (the “Guidelines”).

I have read the Application. The Application complies with the Guidelines, and the fees
and expenses sought fall within the Guidelines, except as may be specifically noted in this
Affidavit and described in the Application.

The fees and expenses sought are billed at rates and in accordance with practices
customarily employed by the Firm and generally accepted by the Firm’s clients.

In seeking reimbursement for the expenditures described on Exhibit 2, the Firm is
seeking reimbursement only for the actual expenditure and has not marked up the actual cost to
- provide a profit or to recover the amortized cost of investment in staff time or equipment or
capital outlay.

In seeking reimbursement for any service provided by a third party, the Firm is seeking
reimbursement only for the amount actually paid by the Firm to the third party.

The following are the variances with the provisions of the Guidelines, the date of each
court order approving the variance, and the justification for the variance: Not applicable.

FURTHER AFFIANT SAITH NAUGHT,

GFr—""
GEOFFREY E. VARGA
Swgm to before me this '
.2 day of Aprijs 2014
& .
Notary Public ANN E. GITTLEMAN

NOTARY PUBLIC-STATE OF NEW YORK
Qualified in Nassau County
My Commission Expires October 29. 016
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Composite Exhibit 4

Contemporaneous Time and Expense Records
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Klnetic arg (Ca -- Decombey 20413 Detall rleg (PB | & I
Datg Category Staff] Time| Rate | Fees Descriptlo
|~ Eees
12/2/2013|Litigatlon Consulling GEV | 0.30 | 760.00 226.00 | Emalls and dlscusslons re disclosure Issues
12/3/2013|Litigallon Consulling AEG | 1.20 | 596.00 714.00 |Review of the proofs of debt and clawbacks (1.2);
12/3/2013|Fea Preparation AEG | 0.30 | 696.00 176.60 |Correspondence rogarding billing golng forward and codes to use. (3)
12/3/2013{LiIgation Consulling GEV | 0.20 | 750.00 160.00 |Emalls and dlacusslons re disclosure lssues
12/6/2013|Fee Preparation KL2 | 0.30 | 376.00 112,50 |Review STAR for racalvable
12/9/2013|Fee Preparation JGO | 0.60 | 206,00 147.60 |Respond to Inquirles regarding 20K recelvable
12/10/2013[Fee Preparalion KL2 | 1.00 | 376.00 376.00 | Revlew of previously filad fae applicalion and involces lo date
12111/2013|Uitigation Gonsulling-Petlers  {AEG | 0.60 | 696.00 476.00 |Review of the Pallars Dockel. (.8)
12/11/2013|Fee Preparailon JGO | 1.30 | 206,00 383,50 |Propare the November Invoice (i7) Finallze and send all Involces to KL for fee
app (.6)
12/12/2013[LItigation Consulting-Petters  |AEG | 0.80 | 695.00 476.00 [Review of Ine docket and bankruploy disclosure review.
12/13/2013|Litigation Consulting-Petters  1JGO | 1.00 } 205.00 206.00 |Review emalls from counsel and relaled Pelters dockels
12/13/2013|Fee Preparation JGO | 0.60 | 206.00 147.50 |Correspondsnce regarding new responsibilities for preparing feo apps. (.6}
12/16/2013|Fee Preparalion KL2 | 0.50 {376.00 187.50 |Begin to prepare 9lh fee app lo bankupley court
12/1712043]Liligation Consulting-GECC __ |AEG | 2.20 | 695.00 1,309.00 |Review of the GEGC snswar (2.2)
12/17/2013|Fee Preparation KL2 | 4.60 | 276.00 | 1,687.50 |Prepare quarterly foe application for Kinelle
12/18/2013(LitIgation Consulling-Pellers 2,80 | 696.00 ] 1,547.00 |[Review other fllings on the docket and Pallers dacket as well, Provlde an
AEG updale to tha liquidator and counsel on findings.
12/18/2013|Feea Preparalion JGO | 2,00 | 295.00 590.00 |Review Palm Baach Finance Fee App
42118/2013|Fee Preparation KL2 | 0,60 | 376.00 187.60 |Updale fee applicallon based on comments from JGO and email
. coirespondence with AEG re the same
12/19/2013]Fee Preparallon KL2 | 0.60 | 376.00 187.50 |Emall correspondence with Maroum on payments B
12/198/2013|L1tigation Consulling GEV | 0.50 | 7580.00 3765.00 |Emalls and discusslons re disclosure Issues
12120/2013{Fee Preparation AEG | 0.8Q | 696.00 476,00 |Begin (o review fee appllcallon.
121207204 3|Litigation Consulling-M&| GEV | 0.70 | 760.00 826.00 |Discusslona re M&I madiation and disclosure mallers
12/23/2013iFee Preparation JGO | 1.50 | 206,00 442,60 COrrlespondence Tegarding fes application. Finalize payment dates and update
Involcea
12/23/2013|Fee Preparalion KL2 | 2.00 | 376,00 750,00 |Review of Oct & Nov MRB Involces
12/23/2013{Fee Preparalion KL2 } 1,60 | 976.00 562.50 {Updates {o fea appllcation based on comments from AEG (.5), review and
addillon of payments recelved based on correspondence with KM al Marcum
1 )
12/26/2013{Fea Preparalion 2.00 | 585.00 | 1,180.00 |Review and pravide comments an the fee application (or the bankruplacy court.
AEG (2.0)
12/26/2013|Litigation Consuiling 5.80 | 696,00 | 1,666.00 |Review the Plan in prep for call with counsel to discuss varlous issues. {1.9);
Call with counsel and JOL to dlacuss responses to counsel's questions(1.2}
AEG
12/26/2013|Fee Preparalion JBO } 1.60 | 206.00 242,60 | Correspondence regarding fee application. Finallze fee applicallon with
oxhiblls and dlscusslon' with KL on the same
12/26/2013|Fee Preparation KL2 | 1.00 | 376.00 376,00 |Correspondence wilh RR on fee application and discuasion wilh JGO on
) finallzallon of fee appllcailon
12{27/2013|LItlgalion Consulling AEG | 1,00 | 685.00 505.00 | Call with counse! and Budwick lo dlacuss Trusi Monltor role,
12/27/2043|Fee Preparation JGO | 1.00 ] 2856.00 206,00 C‘orrelspondence Tegarding fee application, Finalize fee application with
signalures
12/30/2013]Litlgation Consulling 1.60 | 696.00 | 1,071.00 |Review docket for GECC flings and M&d fliings in preparallon (or cail with
: Trustee and counsel, {1.0); Cali with Trustes and counsel to disoues varous
. AEG Issues. (.4); Emalls with counsel to discuss the same, (.4)
12/31/2013]Litigation Consulling AEG | 0.40 | 686,00 238,00 |Emalls with counsel re trust monitor.
Total Feos) 18,380.00
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Inetic P. C Ltd. -- December 2013 Detall Time Eptries (PB |l Estate O
Date Cateqory. Staff| Tlme Rate Fees Descrlption
Fees
1212/2013|Liligation Consulling AEG| 0.90 £85.00 535,60 |Review and provide comments on Affidavit to the
bankruptcy court re purchase of claim. (.5) Numerous
amails with US and Cayman counsel re the same. (.4)
12/3/2013] Litigation Consulling AEG| . 0,60 695,00 357.00 | Review emalls from counsel re Monitor disclosure.
12/4/2013}Litigation Consulling AEG| 0.80 595.00 476.00 [|Search the dockel for updales on relevant cases.
12/5/2013Liligation Consulting AEG] 1.40 595,00 833.00 |Review the participation agreement prlor {o call with
counset re disclosure. (.8); Call with counsel to discuss
disclosure {.6)
Total Fees 2,201.60
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Kinetic Partners (Cayman) Ltd. -- January 2014 Detall Time Entrles (PB | & II)

Date Category ___| Staff| Time | Rate Fees Description

Fees

12/24/2013]Litipation Consulting M&} GEV | 0,70 | 750.00 525.00 |Call re monitor position and M&I medialion; disclosure issues; discussions
regarding same

12/27/2013{Litigatlon Consulting M&l GEV | 1.40 | 750,00 | 1,050.00 [Call re monitor position and M&| mediation; disclosure issues; discussions
regarding same; follow up call i

12/30/2013]|Litigation Consulting M&l GEV | 1.00 1750.00 750,00 |Call re monltor position and M&} mediation; disclosure Issues; discussions
regarding same

12/31/2013|Litigation Consulling-General |GEV | 0.30 |750.00 226.00 |Emalls re disclosure

1/2/2014 [Litlgation Gonsulting M&I 3.80 | 595.00 | 2,261.00 |Review M&I Docket and database to calch up on the matter for pending
AEG mediation. (3.8)
1/2/2014{LItigation Consuiting-General 1.80 | 595.00 | 1,071.00 |Review redactions to participalion agreement and disclosure fillng. (.8);
Revlew emails prior to call with counsel re Participant discussion. (.4) Call
AEG with counsel and Trust monitor to discuss various Issues. (.6)
1/2/2014{Liligation Consuiting M&! GEV | 1.00 | 750.00 750.00 |Call with counsel re disclosure maiters and M&I mediation (.6); related emails
. (4)

1/3/2014 |Fee Preparation AEG | 0.50 } 595,00 297.50 |Review of the fee app for last month and provided comments to staff.

1/3/2014 | Litigation Consulting M&l AEG | 1.80 |585.00 | 1,071.00 |Continued io review M&| documents,

1/3/2014 |Fee Preparation JGO | 0.50 | 285.00 147.50 |Update December involce, and send fo counsel

1/3/2014|Litigation Consuiting M&! GEV ] 0,10 |750.00 75.00 |Emails regarding disclosure matters and M&| medlation

1/68/2014 |Litigation Consuiting M&! 1.40 | 595.00 833.00 |Call with team to discuss memo for M&! Medlation (.2); Call with counsel to
discuss M&I Mediation (.4); Review of mediation statement for M&I Mediation

AEG (.8) '
1/6/2014|Litigation Consulting M&l 1.50 | 205.00 442,50 |Prepared for and attended call for status update on trust monitor role and
M&, also attended call with counsel regarding M&. (.6) Revlew of mediation
JGO |statement for M&l Medlation (.9)

1/612014{Fee Preparation JGO | 0.40 | 295.00 118.00 |Emalls regarding 9th Post Confirmation Fee Application and notary

1/6/2014|Litigation Consuiting M&} KL2 | 1.00 |375.00 375.00 |Call with team to discuss updates to M&l case and upcoming mediation and
call with counsel to discuss the same (.6), correspondence on and sending
through M&! materials In prep to provide GEV with memo for mediation (.4)

1/6/2014 | Litigation Consulting M&| GEV ] 0.20 }750.00 150.00 |Mediation emalls and related docs

17712014 Litigatlon Consulting Mé&t 3.40 | 595.00 | 2,023.00 |[Meeling with team o discuss memo for Trust Monitor re M& litigation for
mediatlon. (.6); Review varlous complaints and legal docs and emalls from

AEG counsel to prepare memo. (2.8)
1/7/2014 | Litigation Consulting M&| 0.70 | 295.00 208.50 |Prepared for (.1) and attended call for status update on trust monitor role and
JGO M&l. (:6)
1/7/2014 | Litigation Consuiting M&! KL2 1 4.10 | 375.00 | 1,537.60 |Meetling with {eam fo discuss trust ‘monitor meme for M&I mediation (.8),
. review case law materials in preparation of preparing a memo for GEV to use
In mediation with M&i (3.5)
1/7/2014{Litigation Consulting M&I JMU | 3.00 | 245.00 735.00 |Meeting with team to discuss memo for Trust Monitor re Mai litigation for
. mediation. (.6); Preparation of Palm Beach Finance l and Il and BMO
Mediation memo for purposes of assisting Géoff Varga In his participation in
the mediation. Time Includes but Is not limited to reading the relevant
materials including Medlation Report, correspondence, BMO Court Order,
BMO Motion o Dismiss, ete. Time atso includes the drafting and revisions of
the actual 5 page memo. (2.4)

1/8/2014 ] Litigation Consulting M&l AEG | 2.00 {595.00 | 1,190.00 |Review cases for M&I memo In the 11th circuit (2.0)

1/8/2014 |Litigation Consulting M&i 3.00 | 295,00 885.00 |Reviewed emails from counsel regarding M&I. Mulliple correspondence
regarding memo. Revlew cases in the 11th circult for memo (2.8). Call with

JGO team to discuss findings and preparation of memo (.4),
1/8/2014|Fee Preparation 0.80 | 295.00 236.00 |Review draft letter for December 2013 Involce. Correspondence regarding -
JGO comments and update

1/8/2014 |Litigation Consulting M&! KL2 | 6.10 | 375.00 | 2,287.50 |Call with team to discuss findings and preparation of memo (.4), review case
materials for 11th circult case and mediation statement (3), numerous
correspondence with team discussing memo (.3), preparation of memo for
GEV (2), review of counsel's emall and incorporate into memo (.4)

4/8/2014 |Litigation Consulting M&l JMU | 4.00 | 245.00 980.00 | Preparation of Palm Beach Finance | and Il and BMO Mediation memo for
purposes of assisting Geoff Varga In his participation in the medlation
meeting to be held on 1/13/2014. Time includes but Is not limited to reading
the relevant materials including Medialion Report, correspondence, BMO
Court Order, BMO Motion to Dismiss, etc. Time also includes the drafling and
revislons of the actual 5 page memo. (4)

1/8/2014 [Litigation Consuiting M&| GEV | 0.10 | 750.00 75,00 |Emails re mediation and docs

11912014 |Fee Preparation JGO | 0.60 | 295,00 147,50 |Review updated draft letter for December 2013 invoice.

1/9/2014 [Litigation Consulting M&| KLz | 3.20 | 375.00 | 1,200.00 |Call with counset fo discuss M&I memo for purposes of mediation and furlher

discuss case law affacting Mal case (.3), calls with team {o discuss updates
to be made to memo and questions/comments on memo and findings to date
(.4), continue to update memo with case law and findings for GEV In prep for

mediation (2.5)
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1/9/2014 | Liligation Consulting M&} JMU | 3.25 1245.00 706.25 |Preparation of Palm Beach Finance | and || and BMO Medlation memo for
purposes of assisting Geoff Varga in his pariicipation in the mediation
meeting to be held on 1/13/2014. Time Includes reading {he relevant
malerials including Mediation Report, correspondence, BMO Court Order,
BMO Motion to Dismiss. Time also includes the drafing and revislons of the
actual 5 page memo, (2.85) Calls with team to discuss updates to be made to
memo and questions/comments on memo and findings to date (.4),
1/9/2014|Litigation Consulting M&I GEV | 0.20 |750.00 150.00 {Emalls re mediation and docs
1/10/2014 | Litigation Consulting M&!| 3,60 | 595.00 | 2,142.00 |Review and revise (numerous times) memo for Trust Monitor/JOL for M&!
AEG 'Medlation. Review case law cited in memo. Call with counsel to discuss
1/10/2014|Fee Preparation JGO | 0.20 | 295.00 59.00 |Review emalls regarding fee rejections
1/10/2014{Litigation Consulting M&} KL2 | 0.40 {375.00 150.00 |Review updated M&! memo for inclusions from counsel's review of case law
1/10/2014|Litigation Consulting M&I JMU | 2.25 | 245.00 551.25 | Preparation of Palm Beach Firance | and I and BMO Mediation memo for
purposes of assisting Geoff Varga In his participation In the mediation
mesting to be held on 1/13/2014. Time Includes but is not limited to reading
the relevant materials Including Medlation Report, correspondence, BMO
Court Order, BMO Motlon to Dismiss, etc. Time also includes the drafting and
revislons of the actual 5 page memo. (2.25)
1/10/2014|LItigation Consuiting M&! GEV | 0.10 | 750.00 75.00 |Emails re mediation and docs
1/12/2014 |Litigation Cansulting M&} GEV | 4.50 [750.00 { 3,375.00 |Travel to MIA for M&|
1/13/2014 |Litigation Consuiting M&! GEV | 8.50 | 750.00 | 8,375.00 [M&I mediation altendance; travel from Mia to NYC
1/47/2014|Fee Preparation KL2 | 1.00 ]375.00 375.00 [Review MRB Involces
1/20/2014]Litlgation Consulling-General |AEG | 1.20 | 595.00 714.00 |Review of the dacket for update on existing matters (1.2)
1/21/2014 |Litigalion Consulting-General |KL2 | 0.80 | 375.00 300.00 |Review email from RR on varlous recent filings (.5), related correspondence
with RR (.3)
1/2212014|LItigation Consuiting GECC GEV { 0.50 | 750.00 375,00 [Emaills re disclosure matters and GECC
1/23/2014]Litigatlon Consulting GECC KL2 | 0.80 | 375.00 300.00 |Review of numerous correspondence with RR on GECC issues
1/23/2014|Fee Preparation KL2 { 0.30 {375.00 112.50 {Correspondence on fees received to date
172372014 |Litigation Consulting GECC GEV | 0.20 | 750.00 150.00 |Emaills re disclosure matters and GECC
1/25/2014 | Litigation Consulting-General [GEV | 0.20 | 750,00 150.00 |Emalls re proposed orders
1/27/2014|Litigation Consulting-General AEG 1.20 | 595.00 714.00 |Discussions and email with counsel re Trust Monitor role and disclosures and
conf call.
1/27/2014|Lillgation Consulting-General [GEV { 1.40 |750.00 | 1,050.00 |Calls re disclosure and related matlers (1.2); follow up on discussions (.2)
1/28/2014|Litigation Consulling-General 1.10 | 596.00 654.50 |Call with counsel, Trust Monitor and Trustee io discuss disclosure Issues; and
AEG call with counsel to discuss call; (1.1)
1/28/2014|Fee Preparation AEG | 0.50 | 595,00 207.50 | Prepare for and atlend fee application hearing (.5)
1/28/2014 |Fee Preparation 1.20 |295.00 354,00 |Prepare for and attend fee application hearing (.5) Review all orders and
JGO - provide comments (.7)
1/28/2014|Fee Preparation KL2 | 0.50 | 375.00 187.50 [Review fee orders
1/28/2014|Litigation Consulting-General |GEV | 1.10 {750.00 825.00 [Calls re disclosure and related matters
1/29/2014|Litigation Consulting-General 0.80 | 595.00 476.00 |Various emails with counsel and call with counsel to discuss UST's concerns
AEG and answer questions re the same.
172912014 Litigation Gonsulting-General |GEV | 0.50 | 760.00 376.00 |Emails re disclosure hearing
1/31/2014|Litigation Consulting-General |GEV | 0.50 }750.00 375,00 |Emalls re disclosure hearing
Total Fees| 43,103.00
Disbursements
1/8/2014| Sundry Expenses 14.95 |Wireless card
1/8/2014| Train/Plane/Ferry/Cost of Parking 21.36 |Cab
11/5/2013|Train/Plane/Ferry/Cost of Parking 715,58 |[Flight and hotel to Miami.
{cancelled the day of)
Taotal Disbursements 761.89
[ |
Total Fees and Dishbursements| 43,854.89
[ 1
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Kinetic Partners (Cayman) Ltd. --Februag 2014 Detail Time Entries (PB 1 & II)

Date Category Staff] Time| Rate Fees Description
Fees
2/3/2014 |Litigation Consulting-General 2.50 | 760,00 1,875.00 |Travel from NY to FL for court hearing re distlosure and related matters;
GEV emails re status of hearing
2/4/2014 | Litigation Gonsulling-General GEV 2.50 } 760.00 1,875.00 |Attendance at court hearing re disclosure; discusslon with counsel re ongoing-
maliers
215/2014{Litigation Consuiting-General 2,70 | 750.00 2,025.00 |Travel from FL to NY (from disclosure hearing); orders re disclosure; call with
GEV counsel re deposition assistance
217/2014 | Litigatlon Consulling-General JGEV | 0.2Q | 760.00 150.00 |Emails re MRB engagement of addltional resources
2/11/2014 |Litigation Consulting-General |GEV | 0.20 | 750,00 150.00 |Emails re fee summary
2/12/2014 |Fee Preparation JGO | 0.80 | 295,00 236.00 |Prepare Involce for January 2014
2/14/2014 | Litlgation Consulting-General  |AEG | 2.00 | 695.00 1,190.00 [Review flle for call with Trustee, Call with Trustee and counsel to discuss
update on matters.
2/14/2014|Fee Proparation JGO | 0.80 | 295.00 236.00 [Update involce for January 2014 for comments recelved. Reviewed latter and
send approvals
2/14/2014 | Litigation Consulling-General |GEV | 0.80 | 750.00 600.00 |Status call with trustee
2/20/2014|Litlgation Consulling-General |GEV | 0.10 | 760.00 76.00 |Discusslons re monltor role
2/27/2014|Litigation Consulting-General |AEG | 1.60 | §95.00 852,00 [Review of the docket and update TM.
2/28/2014|Litigation Consulling-General |AEG | 1.00 | §95.00 595,00 |Prepare list of questions to ask Trustes for call. Call with Trustee to get an
update on the status of the case.
Total Fees 9,959.00




